
Affiliate Program Terms of Service

AgeLess Sciences Inc. (Doing Business As, “NOVOS”)

I. Introduction

a. This document outlines the terms of service ("Terms") governing the affiliate program
("Program") of AgeLess Sciences Inc., doing business as NOVOS ("Company").

b. By participating in the Program, affiliates ("Affiliates") agree to abide by these Terms.
Non-compliance may result in the termination of the Affiliate's participation in the Program
and/or forfeiture of earned commissions.

II. Commission Structure

a. Affiliates will earn a 10% commission on the initial purchase of qualifying sales made through
their unique affiliate link or with their unique coupon code.

b. Commissions are only earned on the initial purchase of recurring subscriptions and not on
subsequent renewal payments.

c. Commission payments will be made on a monthly basis, with a minimum payout threshold of
$100. Payouts will be made via Impact.com.

III. Usage Restrictions

a. Affiliates are prohibited from posting their coupon code or affiliate link on public websites,
including but not limited to, coupon websites.

b. Affiliates are allowed to share their coupon code or affiliate link on their personal channels
such as podcasts, LinkedIn posts, Facebook posts, or through private communication channels
with their or in-person network.

c. Affiliates are responsible for monitoring and ensuring their coupon code or affiliate link does
not appear on restricted sites.

d. Should an Affiliate's coupon code or affiliate link appear on a restricted site, the Affiliate is
required to notify the Company within one week of its publication.

e. Company reserves the right to not consider any sales attributed to Affiliate as valid during the
period in which coupon code or affiliate link appears on restricted sites.

f. If an Affiliate's code appears on restricted sites more than once, the Company reserves the
right to terminate the Affiliate's participation in the Program.

IV. Advertising and Branding

a. Affiliates must not make any false or misleading statements in their promotions and must
adhere to advertising guidelines set by federal, state, and local regulations.



b. Usage of the Company’s brand name is allowed for promotional purposes but must not be
altered, used in a misleading manner, or used in a way that directly states or implies that Affiliate
is an employee, agent, or official representative of Company.

V. Termination

a. The Company reserves the right to terminate an Affiliate's participation in the Program at any
time, with or without cause or prior notice.

b. Affiliates may also choose to terminate their participation at any time by notifying the
Company.

c. Upon termination, any unpaid commissions will be paid out during the next payment cycle,
provided all Terms have been met.

VI. Confidentiality

a. Any information that an Affiliate is exposed to by virtue of their participation in the Program,
which the Company has not made public, is considered confidential and must not be disclosed.

VII. Liability and Indemnification

a. Affiliates agree to indemnify and hold harmless AgeLess Sciences Inc., its officers, directors,
employees, and agents from and against any and all claims, liabilities, damages, losses, or
expenses, including attorney's fees and costs, arising out of or in any way connected with the
Affiliate's breach of these Terms.

VIII. Governing Law

a. These Terms shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the United
States.

IX. Amendments

a. The Company reserves the right to modify or amend these Terms at any time without prior
notice. Continued participation in the Program following any changes signifies acceptance of the
revised Terms.

X. Disclaimer

a. The Company makes no express or implied warranties or representations with respect to the
Program or any products sold through the Program.

XI. Contact

a. For any questions related to these Terms or the Program, please contact [Company Contact
Information].


